
MAYFIELD TOWNSHIP BOARD MEETING
     MARCH 10, 2025

                                                                                                                      
                       

The regular meeting of the Mayfield Township Board was called to order at
the Mayfield Township Hall, at 5:30 p.m. with the Pledge of Allegiance of the
United States of America, by the Supervisor Daniel J. Engelman.

Members Present: Supervisor Daniel J. Engelman, Clerk Julie A. Schlaud, 
                               Trustee Chris Maasch,  Trustee Cheryl J. Kile.

Members Absent:Treasurer Daniel T. Frisch 
                                            
Others Present:, Leslie Getz, Frank Thorman, Becky Thorman, Debbie Fish,
Kyle Powers, Nancy Powers, Jan Watz, David Schlaud, Karen Schlaud, John
Kile, Susan Hough, Karen Rykhus, Carol Brown, Karen Braschayko.

Motion by Kile, seconded by Maasch, PASSED, to waive the reading of the
minutes of the January 13, 2025 regular meeting and approve them.  All
ayes.  One absent.  Carried. 

Motion by Kile, seconded by Maasch, PASSED, to waive the reading of the
January 31, 2025 special meeting and approve them.  All ayes.  One absent. 
Carried.

No Treasurer Report was presented.

Public Time: Annual meeting, library, rezoning, district 9.

Mayfield Township Attorney, Michael Gildner gave an overview of the
Rezoning information of 2746 Fish Lake Road from C-1 to C-2.  A lengthy
discussion was held.  It was stated that the Planning Commission denied the
request.

Motion by Schlaud, seconded by Maasch, PASSED, to approve the rezoning
for 2746 Fish Lake Road, from C-1 to C-2.  Roll call vote: Kile-nay, Maasch-
aye, Frisch-absent, Engelman-aye, Schlaud-aye.  Carried. 

Motion by Schlaud, seconded by Maasch, PASSED, to reaffirm the
appointment of Carol Brown to the Lapeer District Library Board, term ending
December 31, 2025.  All ayes.  One absent.  Carried.    

Motion by Schlaud, seconded by Maasch, PASSED, to approve the roadside
mowing bid with Lapeer Co. Road Commission for a double pass in the
spring and late summer at a cost to the twp of $8,000.00 , as presented.  All
ayes.  One absent.  Carried.  

.



Page 2

Motion by Schlaud, seconded by Maasch, PASSED, to approve  the Road
Project for dust control with up to 3 applications at a total possible cost of
$14,000.00.   All ayes.  One absent.  Carried.

Motion by Schlaud, seconded by Maasch, PASSED, to adopt the Federal  
Earned Sick Time Policy, effective February 21, 2025, as presented.  
 
Committee Reports:
Supervisor Engelman gave report on GLTA, 
Clerk Schlaud gave report on EMS    

Motion by Schlaud, seconded by Kile, PASSED, to pay the bills.  All ayes. 
One absent.  Carried.  

Motion by Schlaud, seconded by Maasch, PASSED, to adjourn.  All ayes. 
Carried.

Meeting adjourned at 6:49 p.m.

 
 

Submitted by,

                                                                                                          
                                                       Julie A. Schlaud
                                                       Mayfield Township Clerk

__________________
Board Approval                                  


